
Guest Speaker Agreement 
 

For The Ascended Masters At Work Podcast. 
 
Shirlene Reeves (from here on in referred to as Host) will record ____________________ (from here on 
in referred to as Expert) for a video/audio interview. Expert understands that for educational, promotional, 
and commercial purposes, the Host will release the Expert’s interview recording for free to all subscribers 
in our listenership. 
  
1. Expert hereby grants the Host the right to use their name, voice, appearance, likeness, image, words, 
participation, and title or professional designation, in whole or in part, in this recording and/or compilations 
and in any correspondence (written, verbal or electronic), publicity, advertising, promotions, or other 
materials derived from them. The Host does not have an obligation to utilize the rights granted herein.  
 
2. Upon request, Expert may request a copy of his or her interview in electronic format, within 30 days 
after the completion of the interview.  
 
3. After the RSS feed link is active Expert agrees to post the show link, within 10 days, on a minimum 
of 5 social media mentions and send the link to their database.  
 
4. Expert is required to offer ONE FREE gift during the interview. The Host agrees to promote Expert’s 
free gift through a unique - active URL provided by the Expert prior to and during the interview.  
 
5. Expert hereby grants the Host, the rights to reproduce the recording in any format and to distribute, sell, 
prepare derived works, advertise, and promote the recording without compensation to the Expert. The 
Host may edit the recording at their discretion, and shall own the worldwide rights, title, and interest, 
including copyright in, and of, the Expert’s recording. However, Expert has the right to use his or her 
recorded interview for any purpose. The material shared in the interview, by the Expert, is and shall 
remain, the sole copyright of the Expert. 
 
6. Expert represents that he or she has the full right, power, and authority to grant this release and to 
perform all of the provisions described herein. Expert agrees that in the event of a breach or alleged 
breach with respect to the terms and provisions of this agreement, that The Host shall be entitled to such 
injunctive or equitable relief as the Host may deem appropriate, in addition to other legal rights the Host 
may have.  
 
7. Expert agrees to indemnify and hold harmless the Host from and against all claims, losses, expenses, 
and liabilities of every kind including reasonable attorney’s fees arising out of the inaccuracy or breach of 
any provision of this Agreement. Expert expressly releases the Host from any and all claims arising out of 
the use of the material.  
 
8. This release shall be governed in accordance within San Diego County, California laws and all 
mediation shall take place in that county regarding any and all claims arising out of the use of the material.  
 
9. This release constitutes the entire agreement between the parties and supersedes any and all 
agreements of any kind previously made by the parties involved.  
 
Please indicate your understanding and agreement with the terms of this release by signing in the space 
provided below. I have read and understand this release.  
 
Print Name:  __________________________     ____________________  
	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 Shirlene	Reeves	-	Host	
Expert Email: __________________________________________ 
  
Expert Signature: _______________________________________  Date: ________________ 	 	
	
 
PLEASE ENTER YOUR NAME AT THE TOP, SIGN AND DATE.  SEND TO: Info@AscendedMastersAtWork.com 


